
 

Event Description Location Date and 
Time 

Property Investors 
Success Day 

In the property market right now, there is so much 
uncertainty.  
 
BREXIT, the tax changes, the finance changes, the 
legislation changes, the changes in leadership...  
 
Have all happened at once.  
 
But where there is uncertainty, there is opportunity 
for you, and the Property Investors Success Day 
will show you how you can CASH in on these 
opportunities. 

Grange 
Hotel St 
Pauls  
St Pauls  
London 
 

8th 
September 
 
9am-6pm 

Premier Property 3 
Day Master Class 

Would you like to fast track your property 
investing career?  
 
Whether you are new to property or extremely 
experienced, this 3 day Master Class will give you 
everything you need to go out into the real world 
and start investing in property. 
 
You will learn all the insider secrets involved in 
property investing, you will be given the exact 
knowledge, tools and teams you need in order to 
invest in property, with complete peace of mind 
and confidence, and know that each step you are 
taking is the right step forward. 

 21st – 23rd 
September 
 
Friday 9am - 
Sunday 5pm 

The HMO 
Bombshell: Keeping 
HMOs Work From 
1st October 2018 
and Beyond 

It’s coming…. 
 
There’s big fines waiting for those who aren’t 
prepared…. 
 
Join us at Premier Property Club Croydon on the 
4th September – an important date for anyone 
who is involved in HMO property investment or 
development and those who are considering 
purchasing their first HMO. 
 
This event is a MUST attend and due to the 
legislation changes coming into effect, extremely 
popular, so please book your place now to secure 
your seat. 
 
Find out more about the regulations which will 
bring mandatory licensing to ALL multi-occupied 
properties. 

Jurys Inn 
Croydon 

4th 
September 
 
6:30pm 

Capital Gains, 
Inheritance and 
Income: The 3 
Biggest Tax Threats 
to you as a Property 
Investor 

Premier Property Club Kent have secured two 
industry experts for one evening to provide the 
inside information on the 3 biggest tax threats 
facing property investors today. 
 
You won’t find this information anywhere else, so 
we urge you to stop what you’re doing and book 
your place now and secure your seat on the 11th 
September at PPC Kent. 

Village 
Hotel 
Maidstone 

11th 
September 
6:30pm 

Land, Planning and 
Development 
Masterclass - How 
to Get Started 

With millions of pounds being pumped into 
redevelopment and regeneration projects 
throughout the UK and it remaining high on the 
political agenda… 
 
NOW is the time to capitalise on this with your 
property investment and development ventures. 
 
Premier Property Club would like to invite you to 
attend our Land, Planning and Development 
Masterclass in Brighton on 6th September. 

Jurys Inn  
Brighton 
 
 

6th 
September 
6:30pm 

Estate Agent's 
Insider Secrets: 
How to Find 
Discounted Deals in 
London 

With the latest reports highlighting London as a 
buyers-market…  
 
NOW is the time to find out just where those 
discounted deals are.  
 
How you can benefit from them and how you can 
secure them before anyone else. 
 
With discounts to property in London anywhere 
between 25-40%, the British Capital is the ideal 
place for property investors and developers to add 
to their portfolios, or for providing the best first 
step for those considering getting their foot on the 
property ladder! 
 
This month’s Premier Property Club Canary Wharf 
will see our speakers give away some of their trade 
secrets when it comes to finding those discounted 
deals. 

Hilton 
Hotel  
Canary 
Wharf  
 

25th August 
6:30pm 

Serviced 
Accommodation in 
the Real World: The 
Systems, Processes 
and Hacks for 
Success 

I’d like to invite you to join us at Premier Property 
Club’s Knightsbridge event on the 19th September, 
where I will be giving you detailed and insightful 
information on serviced accommodation in the real 
world – what they don’t tell you when you first 
start in serviced accommodation and what they 
don’t show you when you start to scale up your 
portfolio.  

Double 
Tree by 
Hilton 
Hotel  
Islington 

12th 
September 
6:30pm 


